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Introduction 

Exminster Marshes are 450ha of flat coastal grazing marshes with neutral lowland grass 

fields separated by ditches (wet fences).  They are located to the west of the Exe estuary, 

from Countess Wear (A379) in the north to Powderham in the south. The marshes have 

multiple owners and as a component part of the Exe Estuary have National (SSSI), European 

(SPA) and International (Ramsar) nature conservation designations.   

The site qualifies for the SSSI  designation mainly for the ditch flora and fauna present at the 

time of designation,  including several Devon rarities such as Parsley water-dropwort, 

Oenanthe lachenalii; Flowering rush, Butomus umbellatus and Frogbit, Hydrocharis morsus-

ranae and a wide variety of dragonflies including the nationally uncommon Ruddy darter, 

Sympetrum sanguineum and Hairy dragonfly, Brachytron pratense.  Exminster Marshes are 

also used by water birds at high tide and provide nesting and feeding habitats for other bird 

species.   

The Exe Estuary is classified as a SPA due to supporting over-wintering waterbird 

assemblage and  wintering populations of European importance of Avocet, Recurvirostra 

avosetta; Slavonian Grebe, Podiceps auritus; Dark-bellied Brent Goose, Branta  bernicla 

bernicla; Eurasian oystercatcher, Haematopus ostralegus; Grey plover, Pluvialis squatarola;  

Dunlin, Calidris alpina alpina; Black-tailed godwit, Limosa limosa islandica.   

The qualifying features for classification as a Ramsar site are similar, with winter waterfowl 

peak counts of 20263 waterfowl (5 year peak mean 1998/99-2002/2003) and internationally 

important numbers of wintering Dark-bellied Brent Goose, Branta bernicla bernicla, 1509 

individuals, representing an average of 1.5% of the GB population (5 year peak mean 

1998/9-2002/3).  Dark-bellied Brent geese occasionally use Exminster Marshes as feeding 

grounds. 

A large area in the middle of the marsh is owned by RSPB and managed as a nature reserve.  

A Water Level Management Plan to balance the requirements of agriculture, flood risk 

management and nature conservation is in place. 

Floating pennywort, Hydrocotyle ranunculoides is a North American species.  It was brought 
ǘƻ .Ǌƛǘŀƛƴ ƛƴ ǘƘŜ мфулΩs by the aquatic nursery trade as an ornamental plant, but it soon 
became established in the wild.  It is a highly invasive species that can grow up to 20cm a 
day, roots freely from nodes and can form extensive mats from the smallest root fragment, 
with maximum growth in late summer. The dense mats kill other aquatic species by starving 
the water body of light, nutrients and oxygen and can also increase the risk of flooding.   

In September 1999 Floating pennywort was discovered just south of the M5, in ditches 

flowing from Exminster village. The ditches affected by Floating pennywort were in a 

triangular area bounded by the M5 to the north, the main Exeter-Penzance railway line to 

the west and the Exeter canal to the east.  The majority of Floating pennywort was found to 

the north of Station Road. 



Due to the major importance of Exminster Marshes for nature conservation it was 
imperative that the Floating pennywort was brought under control.  The marshes act as a 
flood storage area for Exeter but even if the ditches were choked with vegetation (including 
Floating pennywort) it would not have a significant effect on the amount of water able to be 
stored. The floodwater would move overland as well.  However, the Environment Agency 
carries out the regular ditch maintenance works, developed the Water Level Management 
Plan and so felt there was a moral responsibility to control the Floating pennywort.  

 

 

1. Ditch choked with Floating pennywort, with M5 bridge in background 1999 

 

 

2. Ditch choked with Floating pennywort 



Location Map showing all ditches affected 1999-2009 

 

 



Removal and control 

After Floating pennywort was discovered in September 1999 it was felt that mechanical 
control would be too disruptive and damaging for the ditch flora and fauna so while the 
problem was still confined to 6 ditches EA sprayed Diquat as Reglone.  Although this was 
initially effective the plant soon recovered and continued to spread.  

 

3. Spraying with Reglone 

 

 

4. Ditch with sprayed Floating pennywort 



A flood in December 1999 spread fragments further downstream.  In 2000 the Environment 
Agency began a more co-ordinated removal and control project, with part funding by 
Natural England.  However, repeated spraying with Reglone at a higher concentration than 
in 1999 left the apical buds unaffected and caused adverse publicity as well as health and 
safety issues.  The cattle were excluded during the year. 

Serious flooding across Devon during 2001 resulted in a backlog of flood defence work, 
restrictions due to the Foot and Mouth outbreak meant all EA operations were halted.  The 
control programme was delayed but some removal took place during the routine 
maintenance. 

 

 

5. Flooding spreading fragments of Floating pennywort downstream 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



In 2002 the removal programme was re-started with the floating carpets dredged by 
diggers, loaded into silage trailers, allowed to drain and then removed to a compost site.  

 

 

6. Removal of floating mat 

 

7. Loading into silage trailers prior to removal to compost site 

 

 

 


